
Introduction 
This service manual describes the service procedures 
for the TRX300EX. 

This Model Specific Manual includes every service 
procedure that is of a specific nature to this particular 
model. Basic service procedures that are common to 
other Honda Motorcycles/Motor Scooters/ATVs are 
covered in the Common Service Manual. 
This Model Specific Service Manual should be used 
together with the Common Service Manual in order 
to provide complete service information on all 
aspects of this motorcycle. 

Follow the Maintenance Schedule (Section 3) recom-
mendations to ensure that the vehicle is in peak oper-
ating condition. 
Performing the first scheduled maintenance is very 
important. II compensates for the initial wear that 
occurs during the break-in period. 

Sections 1 and 3 apply whole motorcycle. Section 2 
illustrates procedures for removal/installation of 
components that may be required to perform service 
described in the following sections. 
Sections 4 through 17 describe parts o f the 
motorcycle, grouped according to location. 

Find the section you want on this page, then turn to 
the table of contents on the first page of the section . 

Most sections describe the service procedure through 
a system illustration. Refer to the next page for 
details on how to use this manual. 

If you don't know the source of the trouble, go to 
section19 Troubleshooting. 
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